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Advanced Manufacturing                                
Center of Excellence 

MSU Denver University Center 

The Advanced Manufacturing Sciences 

Institute (AMSI) at Metropolitan State 

University of Denver (MSU Denver) 
hosts the University Center. MSU Den-

ver is host to a new Industry 4.0 Center 
of Excellence at Auraria that aims to 

help manufacturers successfully imple-
ment digital transformation technolo-

gies resulting in streamlined operations, 

improved product affordability, and 
increased competitiveness. The focus 

of the Auraria Campus Advanced Manu-
facturing University Center program is 

to conduct research and offer technical 

assistance through applied research 
and partnership to all parts of the state 

including underserved areas around the 
existing campus. This University Center 

helps manufacturing industries to de-

velop new products, or create new and 
better manufacturing processes, on a 

fee-for-service basis, using Artificial 
Intelligence (AI) and Machine Learning 

(ML) technologies. 

Activities 

1.  MSU Denver will collaborate with 

manufacturing partners to identify re-
gional training and curriculum needs in 

AI/ML technologies, identify gaps in 
existing training content, and develop 

additional content to meet employer 

needs. 

2.  Develop new AI models with intrinsic 

interpretability and increased adapta-
bility to support Advanced Manufactur-

ing.  

 

3.  Based on the review, current re-
search gaps and future research direc-
tions will be identified in additive man-
ufacturing industries. The Center will 
organize a series of workshops led by 
industry experts to deliver the training 
curriculum developed by MSU Denver. 
The Center will also build community 
and professional development among 
the cohort through workshops and aca-
demic experiences. 

4.  MSU Denver will implement predic-
tive maintenance systems that utilize 
AI algorithms to forecast machinery 
failures, allowing manufacturers to 
schedule maintenance activities pro-
actively, minimize downtime, and opti-
mize operational costs. 

Success 

Connecting manufacturing partners 
and higher educational institutes to 
accelerate research and regional busi-
ness expansion. The University Center 
acts as a connector between the Uni-
versity and industry partners by provid-
ing access to an abundance of re-
sources including faculty expertise, 
research centers, state-of-the-art facil-
ities, and student talent. 

Network Anchor Partners 

• Metropolitan State University                       
of Denver 

• University of Colorado Denver 

• Colorado School of Mines 

• Big Metal Additive 

• Reata Engineering & Machine 
Works 

 


